Item #

1A)

1B)

2A)

2B)

3A)

3B)

4A)

Item Name

Class I-Bituminous
Concrete: Price per Ton
at Plant:

Class I- Bituminous
Concrete: Price per Ton
Delivered:

Class ll-Bituminous
Concrete: Price per Ton
at Plant:

Class ll-Bituminous
Concrete: Price per Ton
Delivered:

Class llI-Bituminous
Concrete: Price per Ton
at Plant:

Class IlI-Bituminous
Concrete: Price per Ton
Delivered:

Class IV-Bituminous
Concrete: Price per Ton
at Plant:

L Suzio/York
Hill Co's
975 Westfield
Rd
Meriden, CT
06450

$81.50
Meriden

$86.59

$87.25
Meriden

$92.34

$94.25
Meriden

$99.34

$82.50
Meriden

Tilcon CT Inc

PO Box 1357

New Britain,
CT 06050

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Stone
Construction
Colinc
168 Main St So
Southbury, CT
06448

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

H E Butler

Construction Co

LLC
984 Portland
Cobalt Rd
Portland, CT
06480
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Palmer Paving
Corp

25 Blanchard Rd

Palmer, MA
01069

$90.00

No Bid

$98.00

No Bid

$108.00

No Bid

$102.00

Staxx
Construction
Services LLC
84 Bernard St

Berlin, CT 06037

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Modern Materials
Corp
2895 State Street
Hamden, CT
06517

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



4B)

5A)

5B)

6A)

68)

7A)

7B)

8A)

Class IV-Bituminous $87.59
Concrete: Price per Ton

Delivered:

Class 12 Bituminous $96.00
Concrete: Price per Ton Meriden
At Plant:

Class 12 Bituminous $101.09
Concrete: Price per Ton

Delivered:

Hot Mix Asphalt $101.00

Superpave 0.50 Design Leve Meriden
Per St. of CT DOT Requirements
Price per Ton at Plant

Hot Mix Asphalt $106.09
Superpave 0.50 Design Level 2

Per St. of CT DOT Requirements

Price per Ton

Hot Mix Asphalt Superpave $101.00
1.0 Design Level 2 Meriden
Per St of CT DOT Requirements

Price per Ton at Plant:

Hot Mix Asphalt Superpave $106.09
1.0 Design Level 2

Per St. of CT DOT Requirements

Price per Ton

Tack Coat Emulsion: $60.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$109.00

Windsor Locks

No Bid

$102.00
Windsor Locks

No Bid

$102.00

Windsor Locks

No Bid

$60.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$70.00



8B)

9A)

98B)

10)

11)

12)

13)

14)

15A)

Price per 5 Gallon Pail
at Plant:

Tack Coat Emulsion:
Price per 5 Gallon Pail

Delivered:

Class 5 Cold Patch,
Price per Ton at Plant:

Winter Hot Mix (Non-

Meriden

No Bid

$123.00

No Bid

Recycled, Price per Ton at Plant:

3,000 PSI Test Concrete
Price per Cubic Yard
Delivered:

3,500 PSI| Test Concrete
Price per Cubic Yard
Delivered

4,000 PSI Test Concrete,
Price per Cubic Yard
Delivered

4,500 PSI Test Concrete
Price per Cubic Yard
Delivered

5,000 PSI Test Concrete
Price per Cubic Yard
Delivered

1/2” Stone,

$135.00

$139.00

$143.00

$147.00

$151.00

$24.55

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$34.05

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Windsor Locks

No Bid

$135.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$28.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$11.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



15B)

16A)

16B)

17A)

17B)

18A)

18B)

19A)

19B)

20A)

208B)

Price per Ton at Plant

1/2” Stone, Price
per Ton,

3/4”Stone,
Price per Ton at Plant:

3/4” Stone, Price per
Ton, Delivered:

1 1/4” Stone,
Price per Ton at Plant:

1 1/4” Stone, Price per
Ton, Delivered:

3/4” Processed Stone,
Price per Ton at Plant:

3/4"” Processed Stone,
Price per Ton, Delivered:

1 1/4” Processed Stone,
Price per Ton at Plant

1 1/4” Processed Stone,
Price per Ton, Delivered:

Crushed Recycled Aggregat

4”Minus: Price per Ton
At Plant:

Crushed Recycled Aggregat

$28.16

$21.80

Meriden

$25.41

$20.65

Meriden

$24.26

$14.45

Meriden

$18.06

$14.45

Meriden

$18.06

$9.65

$13.26

$39.80

$31.25

Wallingford

$37.00

$29.15

Wallingford

$34.90

$18.60

Wallingford

$24.35

$18.60

Wallingford

$24.35

No Bid

No Bid

$38.35

No Bid

$37.60

No Bid

$37.20

No Bid

$28.75

No Bid

$24.50

No Bid

$23.75

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$28.00

Windsor Locks

No Bid

$28.00

Windsor Locks

No Bid

$28.00

Windsor Locks

No Bid

$28.00

Windsor Locks

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$39.00

No Bid

$39.00

No Bid

$39.00

No Bid

$29.00

No Bid

$29.00

No Bid

$25.00

No Bid

$31.00

Hamden

$36.00

No Bid

No Bid

$25.50

Hamden

$30.50

$30.00

Hamden

$36.00

$14.00
Hamden

$19.00



21A)

21B)

22A)

22B)

23A)

23B)

24A)

24B)

25A)

25B)

4”Minus: Price per Ton
Delivered:

Reclaimed Aggregate
1 1/4” Minus, Price per Ton
At Plant:

Reclaimed Aggregate
1 1/4” Minus, Price per Ton
Delivered

Modified Rip-Rap,
Price per Ton at Plant:

Modified Rip-Rap,
Price per Ton Delivered:

Intermediate Rip-Rap
Price per Ton at Plant:

Intermediate Rip-Rap,
Price per Ton Delivered:

Standard Rip-Rap,
Price per Ton at Plant:

Standard Rip-Rap,
Price per Ton Delivered:

Screenings, Price
per Ton at Plant:

Screenings, Price per
Ton, Delivered:

$13.90
Meriden

$17.51

$22.20
Meriden

$27.27

$22.80

Meriden

$27.87

$23.55

Meriden

$28.62

$16.00

Meriden

$19.61

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$32.65

Wallingford

No Bid

$34.05

Wallingford

No Bid

$20.00

Wallingford

$25.75

No Bid

$21.50

No Bid

$34.60

No Bid

$35.60

No Bid

$35.60

No Bid

$27.75

$7.50
Portland

$15.25

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$26.00

Windsor Locks

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$24.00

Windsor Locks

No Bid

No Bid

$25.00

No Bid

$36.00

No Bid

$36.00

No Bid

$36.00

No Bid

$28.00

$11.00
Hamden

$16.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$8.50

Hamden

$14.50



26)

27)

28)

29A)

29B)

30A)

308)

Full Concrete Block $49.00

(2ftHX3ftWX4ftL)- Meriden
PICKED UP:

Half Concrete Block $41.00
(2ftHX3ftWX2ftL)- Meriden
PICKED UP

Disposal/Recycling: $9.75
City will deliver materials Meriden

such a clean concrete, asphalt,
brick and rock only to the
Contractor’s site or other
approved location):

PRICE PER TON:

Temporary PreCast No Bid
Concrete Barrier Curb:

Price per Linear Foot at

Plant:

Temporary PreCast No Bid
Concrete Barrier Curb:

Price per Linear Foot

Delivered to Various

Locations:

Washed Sand: $34.00
Price per TON at Meriden
Plant:

Washed Sand: $37.61

Price per TON,

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$36.75

No Bid

No Bid

$28.00

Portland

No Bid

No Bid

$32.00
Portland

$39.75

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$45.00

No Bid

No Bid

$20.00
Hamden/Bloomfield

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



31A)

31B)

32A)

328)

32Q)

P-Card
Accep

Paym
ent

P-Card
Discou

Delivered:

Mason Sand:
Price per TON at
Plant:

Mason Sand:
Price per TON,
Delivered:

Screened Sand
Delivered Mon-Fri
Delivered Price per Ton:

Screened Sand
Delivered Saturdays,
Sundays Or Holidays
Delivered Price per Ton:

Screened Sand
Picked-Up Price per Ton:

$36.00
Meriden

$39.61

$34.61

No Bid

$31.00
Meriden

Yes

0% net 30

No

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No

1% net 20

No

No Bid

$37.75

$32.75

No Bid

No Bid

No

0% net 30

No

$32.50
Portland

$40.25

$21.00

$21.00

$13.25
Portland

Yes

0% net 30

No

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No

0% net 30

No

No Bid

$45.00

$45.00

$45.00

No Bid

No

0% net 30

No

$38.00
Hamden

$42.00

$42.00

$45.00

$38.00
Hamden/Bloomfield

No

0% net 30

No
























