
B022-46 CHEMICALS

BID TABULATION

FOR: VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

DATE: June 8, 2022

SUBMITTED BY: Susan Martel

APPARENT LOW BIDS HIGHLIGHTED IN YELLOW

ITEM # Price Desc. Borden & Remington Corp UNIVAR USA Inc Kuehne Chemical Co Inc Holland Company Inc Chemrite, Inc. Carus Corporation Shannon Chemical General Carbon Corp. Kemira Water Solutions Inc G.Coyne Chemical Co JCI Jones Chemicals PVS Minibulk Inc

1 - Sodium Hypochlorite Per Gallon $2.5325 $2.2540 $1.9500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.1200 $2.0500

2 - Calcium Hypochlorite Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.1231* No Bid No Bid

3A - Liquid Caustic Soda 25% Per Gallon $1.7996 $1.9970 $2.6667 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.3000

3B - Liquid Caustic Soda 50% (55 Gallon Drum) Per Gallon $5.6533 $5.4300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 - Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (50 lb Bag) Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5- Liquid Sodium Permanganate (275 Gallon Tote) Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.1600 $14.7376 $17.1700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 - Sodium Fluoride (50 lb Bag) Per Pound No Bid $3.1625 No Bid No Bid $2.5700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 - Granular Phosphate Blend (5 Gallon Pail) Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.7900 $3.8000 $2.6400 No Bid No Bid 3.8889/3.6356 50# Bags** No Bid No Bid

8 - Activated Carbon Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.8000 No Bid $4.0933 No Bid No Bid

9 - Powdered Activated Carbon Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 - Liquid Ferric Chloride Per Pound $2.3553 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.2300 No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 - PolyAluminum Chloride Liquid Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.7300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Min 5 Pail Delivery  

to one location

**Min 6000 # Delivery

to one location

B022-46 CHEMICALS

For: Various Departments

DATE: June 8, 2022

Time: 11:00 AM

APPARENT LOW BIDDERS 

1.   Kuehne Chemical Co Inc  -   $1.9500

2.    G.Coyne Chemical Co  -  $4.1231*

3A   Borden & Remington  -  $1.7996

3B   UNIVAR USA Inc  - $5.4300 

4     Holland Company Inc  -   $2.2500

5     Carus Corporation  -  $14.7376 

6     Chemrite, Inc.   -  $2.5700 

7     Shannon Chemical  -  $2.6400

8     General Carbon Co  -  $2.8000

9     No Bids Received

10   Borden & Remington   -  $2.3553

11   Holland Company Inc  - $2.7300


